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[Denis, Estelle 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

Hi Barb, 

Cadieux, Pauline 
24 août 2005 15:08 
Tulk, Barb 
Magnan, Linda; Denis, Estelle; Lévesque, Monique 
FW: Political donations 

NM - 1 

The payment request for Political donations must be approved by Pierre Anctil. Therefore, please in the future, send the 
invoices or documents directly to his assistant, Linda Magnan. 

Thank you! 

-----Original Message-----
From: Lévesque, Monique 
Sent: Wednesday, August 24, 2005 2:52 PM 
To: Cadieux, Pauline 
Subject: RE: Political donations 

-----original Message-----
From: Cadieux, Pauline 
Sent: Wednesday, August 17, 2005 8:50AM 
To: Nadeau, Nicole; Tulk, Barb 
Cc: Lévesque, Monique 
Subject: RE: Political donations 

Hi Barb, 

Please forward the payment request to Monique Lévesque. 

Thank you! 

-----Original Message-----
From: Nadeau, Nicole 
Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2005 1:45 PM 
To: Cadieux, Pauline 
Subject; fW; Political donations 

-----Original Message-----
From: Tulk, Barb 
Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2005 10:14 AM 
To: Nadeau, Nicole 
Subject: Political donations 

Hi, 

Ches Roe forwarded an e-mail from Krish Krishnamoorthy regarding donations. He said "Ali political donations 
are approved and paid out of Montreal". 

1 have a 500.00 political donation. To whom would 1 send this? 

Also, ali charitable donations over 500.00 must be submitted to the donations committee. To whom would 1 send 
this? 

Thanks, 
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